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JOBS
Eng. Mngr
Vesuvius USA Corp is 
seeking an Eng. Mngr., 
Adv. Refractories Division 
at Chicago Heights, IL of-
fi ce. Manage eng design 
of capital investmnt projs, 
ensuring design, equip, 
& processes are suitable 
for the refractory industry. 
Reqs: Bach in Mech. Eng. 
or a rel. fi eld & 2 yrs exp in 
job off rd or rltd occ to incl 
2 yrs exp w/ the devlpmnt 
of equip for Adv Refracto-
ries casting & heat treat-
ment; 2 yrs exp in design 
facilities & machines for 
adv refractories in 3D 
CAD; 2 yrs exp in resolvg 
techncl probs & recom 
productn improvmnts for 
THC operatns; & 2 yrs 
exp in resolvg techncl 
probs & recom productn 
improvmnts for Mono 
mixing using Eirich mix-
ers. Incumbent must be 
willing to travel 50% on 
international & domestic 
trips lasting 1-2 weeks 
in duration. Emplyr will 
accept any combo of edu, 
trn’g, & exp. Exp may be 
gained concurrently. Inter-
ested applicants should 
e-mail their resumes to 
Janice Thompson, HR Di-
rector Advanced Refrac-
tories NAFTA, at Janice.    
thompson@vesuvius.com 
& ref “Engineering Manag-
er, Advanced Refractories 
Division” in the subject line.

HOTYD LLC is seek-
ing a Computer and 
Information Systems 
Manager to Lead the 
development of website 
and data analysis tools; 
Investigating and trouble-
shooting potential bugs in 
the platform etc. Position 
requires a Bachelor’s De-
gree in Computer Science 
or related. 1 Year’ expe-
rience as a Computer 
and Information Systems 
Manager or related; Must 
have experience with da-
tabase management etc. 
Any interested applicants 
can email their resume 
with code HOTYD2022 to: 
Heng Shi, HOTYD LLC, 
1217-1219 W Fullerton 
Ave, Chicago, IL 60614.

Technical  Solut ions 
Engineer @ Stripe, Inc. 
(Chicago, IL and various 
unanticipated locations 
across the US) Communi-
cate w a number of exter-
nal engineers & develop-
ers & aid them in building 
their apps against Stripe’s 
infrastructure in a number 
of programming lan-
guages including Java, 
Python, Ruby, PHP, Go, 
NodeJS, .NET, ReactJS, 
React Nat ive, Swift , 
Objective-C, Kotlin, and 
Java for Android. Job 
req’s Bachelor’s degree in 
Comp Sci, Engineering or 
similar & 2 yrs of full-stack 
development exp in min-
imum 2 frameworks. To 
be considered, applicants 
must send resume to 
ad-reply@stripe.com ref 
job code 3124892.

Path Digital Advisors, 
LLC in Chicago, Illinois 
is looking for a Machine 
Learning Data Engineer. 
Job duties: Apply data 
mining, data modeling, 
natural language pro-
cessing, and machine 
learning to extract and 
analyze information from 
large structured and 
unstructured datasets; 
design and build the 
company’s data pipeline 
by integrating several 
data sources together; 
perform data analytics 
and create the compa-
ny’s data dashboards in 
Tableau using SQL and 
Tableau software; visual-
ize, interpret, and report 
data findings; use ma-
chine learning to model 
data to assist in improv-
ing current products, user 
experience and retention; 
use the computer for data 
analysis and solution for 
business problems; en-
sure optimal data delivery 
architecture is consistent 
th roughout  ongo ing 
projects. Requirements: 
Master’s degree in En-
gineering. Knowledge 
of Machine Learning; 
Natural Language Pro-
cessing; Reinforcement 
Learning; Deep Learning 
including Convolutional 
Neural Networks, Struc-
turing Machine Learning 
Projects, and Sequence 
Models; Big Data Man-
agement; and Investment 
Portfolio Management. 
Profi cient in Python, SQL, 
R Coding Languages and 
Tableau. Apply at https://
path .bamboohr.com/
careers/76.

TransUnion, LLC seeks 
Managers for Chicago, 
IL location to manage & 
support jr colleagues on 
Analytics team. Master’s 
in Stats/Applied Math/
Actuar ia l  Sci/related 
Quantitative field+2yrs 
exp req’d. Req’d skills: 
extensive exp w/credit 
pol icy & data,  new 
account underwriting, 
credit-risk mgmt; dev 
of  s tats  models ( lo-
gistic, GBM/XGBoost 
scorecards, decision 
trees) to predict risk or 
marketing outcomes; 
generating insights & 
ensuring dissemination, 
understanding;  data 
query languages (SQL, 
R); Hadoop, Hive, Spark, 
Dremio & Pig on Linux & 
PC platforms; segmen-
tation analysis, logistic 
regression, performance 
analysis, generalized lin-
ear models w/CGLM, tree 
models (Random forest, 
Gradient Boosted trees), 
GBM, Artificial Neural 
Network models; deliv-
ering analytical insights 
& recommendations in 
succinct & compelling 
presentations for internal 
& external customers 
& executive audience. 
60% te lecommut ing 
permitted. Apply online: 
https://trans union.wd5.
myworkdayjobs. com, 
Requisition ID: 19019502.

Senior Business Ana-
lystpositions available 
with McKinsey & Com-
pany, Inc. US in Chica-
go, IL. Determine & apply 
appropriate analytical 
skills & tech expertise to 
mgmt consult engage-
ments & complete dis-
crete pieces of study or 
work stream such as data 
gathering, factual & stats 
analys incl mathematical 
modeling & synthesis of 
findings for specific bus 
problem. Meet w/ clients 
assess their needs & 
collect appropriate data 
through written surveys, 
interviews & the like. Min 
ed req’s are a Bachelor’s 
in Bus Admin, Fin, Econ, 
or non-business under-
graduate degree. Appli-
cants for these positions 
must have 2 yrs exp as a 
Business Analyst with a 
major top-tier int’l man-
agement consulting fi rm. 
Domestic & international 
travel typically required. 
Destination and frequen-
cy impossible to predict. 
Email your resume to 
CO@mckinsey.com and 
refer to CTR0928. Multi-
ple positions. No phone 
calls please. An EOE.

M a t e r i a l s  D e s i g n 
Engineers
QuesTek Innovations, LLC 
seeks Materials Design 
Engineers for Evanston, 
IL location to work w/& 
lead proj teams to design 
& invent novel materials. 
Ph.D. in Materials Sci & 
Eng/related field req’d. 
Req’d edu/exp: Eng 
Alloys, Integrated Com-
putational Materials Eng, 
Crystal Plasticity FEM, 
Uncertainty Quantifica-
tion, Machine Learning, 
Materials Fatigue. 40% 
telecommuting permitted. 
Send resume to: P. Ko-
taru, pkotaru@questek.
com, REF: GW

Te c h n i c a l  S u p p o r t 
Analysts Chicago, IL:
Develop Company KPI’s 
and a process for tracking 
and reporting them. Pro-
vide recommendations 
on consolidating, chang-
ing, or adding financial 
software tools. Analyze 
trial data and determine 
if there our opportunities 
for better conversion 
rates. Work from home 
permitted. Send res 
to: Barchart.com, Inc. 
HRgroup@barchart.com.

Property Manager: Chi-
cago IL. Manage, monitor 
financial performance 
of portfolio of properties 
(multi-family commercial). 
Foster working relations 
w/tenants, clients, own-
ers. Sup maintenance & 
adm staff . Advertise avail-
able rental space. Prep 
proposals, contracts, 
financial analysis. Inves-
tigating, resolving tenant 
complaints, requests, en-
force rules of occupancy, 
inspect units & complete 
repairs. Plan renovations. 
HS. 12 months exp. Res: 
Hoyne Suites LLC; rental-
seasy@yahoo.com

Associate Attorney 
(Morton Grove, IL) Pro-
vide legal consultation & 
representation for mostly 
Korean speaking clients; 
draft & review legal docs 
relating to real estate 
transactions, & domestic 
& int\’l business transac-
tions; negotiate terms & 
conditions of real estate 
& business transactions; 
due diligence review, & 
monitor legal risk, & ad-
vise clients accordingly; 
interpret laws, rulings, & 
regs for real estate & busi-
ness transactions; & liti-
gate transaction disputes 
in court. JD deg from 
accredited law school; IL 
Bar admission; & bilingual 
in English & Korean. Send 
resume to Law Offi  ces of 
C.K. & Associates, LLC, 
8930 Waukegan Rd, Ste 
210, Morton Grove, IL 
60053. EOE.

Specialist w/ MCK-
INSEY & COMPANY, 
INC. US (Chicago, IL). 
Act as core member of 
the McKinsey team to 
shape product vision & 
build fully functioning web 
& mobile apps for clients 
from IT modernization & 
strategy to agile, cloud, 
cybersecurity, & digital 
transformation. Telecom-
muting permitted. Req’s 
Master’s degree in IT, 
Mgmt Info Sys, Comp Sci, 
or rel fi eld or the foreign 
degree equiv & 2 yrs of 
exp working in an Agile 
org as s/w developer 
or rel occupation; OR a 
Bachelor’s degree in IT, 
Mgmt Info Sys, Comp Sci, 
or rel fi eld or the foreign 
degree equiv & 5 yrs of 
progressive, post-bacca-
laureate, exp working in 
an Agile org as s/w de-
veloper or rel occupation. 
Exp must incl: focus on 
design, product or data; 
involvement in product 
design decisions across 
concept, prototyping, 
pre-production, produc-
tion, testing, forecast, 
promotion & end-to-end 
support ;  End-to-end 
knowledge of product 
dvlpmnt & user exp; using 
2 of the following apps: 
JavaScript, TypeScript, 
React, Angular, Vue, or 
jQuery; API: Java, Spring 
Boot, C#, .NET, or Node.
js; databases: MySQL, 
SQL Server, MongoDB, 
or cloud-native databas-
es; Cloud infrastructure: 
AWS, Azure, or GCP; 
DevOps: Jenkins, Docker, 
CircleCI, or Travis; Using 
Agi le methodologies; 
Scrum framework; Design 
tools: InVisionApp, Miro, 
Balsamiq, or Zeplin. At 
least one of the following 
Workflow mgmt tools: 
JIRA, Confluence, or 
Azure boards. Domestic 
& int’l travel typically req. 
Destination & frequency 
impossible to predict. 
Email your resume to 
CO@mckinsey.com & 
refer to Job # 6461992. 
No phone calls please. 
An EOE

StoneX Group Inc. seeks 
a Financial Data Engi-
neer II (Job Code 3549) 
in Chicago, IL to execute 
rapid raw data collection 
from source systems; 
target and implement effi  -
cient storage of data, and 
employ fast and reliable 
access patterns. Develop 
data-dr iven f inancial 
enterprise applications 
using knowledge of data 
structures, algorithms, 
and fi nancial data. Please 
visit https://www.stonex.
com/careers/ to apply. 
Job Req. ID # 3549. EOE.

TECHNICAL
Cisco Systems, Inc. is 
accepting resumes for 
mult iple posit ions in 
Chicago, IL:  Network 
Support Engineer (Ref#: 
CHI171D): Responsible 
for the operational sup-
port of internal network 
systems. Telecommuting 
permitted. Product Man-
ager, Engineering (Ref#: 
CHI119D): Responsible 
for managing the develop-
ment and implementation 
of new product introduc-
tion engineering activities 
to meet production launch 
schedules, quality and 
cost objectives. Tele-
commuting permitted. 
Software QA Engineer 
(Ref#: CHI104D): Debug 
software products through 
the use of systematic 
tests to develop, apply, 
and maintain quality 
standards for company 
products. Telecommuting 
permitted. Technical 
Training Specialist (Ref#: 
CHI389D): Deliver tech-
nical training sessions for 
the company’s Enterprise 
Network (Meraki) products 
in major cities throughout 
the Americas region. 
Telecommuting permitted 
and travel may be required 
to various unanticipated 
locat ions throughout 
the United States and/
or abroad. Please mail 
resumes with reference 
number to Cisco Systems, 
Inc., Attn: G51G, 170 W. 
Tasman Drive, Mail Stop: 
SJC 5/1/4, San Jose, CA 
95134.  No phone calls 
please.  Must be legally 
authorized to work in the 
U.S. without sponsorship. 
EOE. www.cisco.com

Logistics Operations 
Manager: Plan, direct 
services of transp comp: 
loading, warehousing, 
distr, forecasting, cus-
tomer serv. Manage per-
sonnel/logistic systems. 
Direct daily op. Sup disp, 
admin workers, create 
policies, resolve problems. 
Bachelor in Logistics. 1 yr 
exp. Res: MSG Truck Ser-
vice; 11316 70th PL, Indi-
an Head Park IL 60525.

SR. SOFTWARE ENGI-
NEER CollectiveHealth, 
Inc. has job opp. in 
Chicago, IL: Sr. Software 
Engineer. Dsgn & dvlp SW 
services for healthcare 
prdcts. To apply email 
resumes referencing 
Req. #MYG34 to people-
ops-support@collective-
health.com

Technical Solutions 
Engineer @ Stripe, Inc.
(Chicago, IL and various 
unanticipated locations 
across the US) Fully 
remote work available. 
Communicate w a number 
of external engineers & 
developers & aid them in 
building their apps against 
Stripe’s infrastructure in a 
number of programming 
languages including Java, 
Python, Ruby, PHP, Go, 
NodeJS, .NET, ReactJS, 
React Native, Swift, 
Objective-C, Kotlin, and 
Java for Android. Job 
req’s Bachelor’s degree in 
Comp Sci, Engineering or 
similar & 2 yrs of full-stack 
development exp in min-
imum 2 frameworks. To 
be considered, applicants 
must send resume to 
ad-reply@stripe.com ref 
job code 3124892.

Advisory Manager with 
Crowe, LLP (Chicago, 
IL) Pln, drct, or coord the 
wrk actvts & rsrcs ncssry 
for mfctrg prdcts in ac-
crdnc w cst, qual, & quan 
specs. Reqs up to 80% 
domestic trvl. Reqs ed & 
exp. For full job details, 
all reqs & to apply online, 
visit: bit.ly/CroweIL100

TransUnion  Renta l 
Screening Solutions, 
Inc. (wholly owned sub-
sidiary of TransUnion, 
LLC) seeks Sr. Develop-
ers for various & unantic-
ipated worksites through-
out the US (HQ: Chicago, 
IL )  to  des ign,  dev, 
maintain, install & test sw 
apps. Master’s in Comp 
Sci/Eng/Info Sys/Info 
Tech or any Eng/related 
field+2yrs exp or Bach-
elor’s in Comp Sci/Eng/
Info Sys/Info Tech or any 
Eng/related field+5yrs 
exp req’d. Req’d skills:.
NET dev (Visual Studio), 
TFS; full stack dev (C#, 
Angular); REST Web ser-
vices; ORM tools, Entity; 
Database dev (advanced 
SQL); TDD; Agile/Scrum; 
AWS cloud dev. 100% 
telecommuting permit-
ted. Apply online: https://
trans union.wd5.mywork-
dayjobs.com /transunion, 
REF: 19019468

Complex Commercial/
Insurance Litigation As-
sociate (Jenner & Block 
LLP; Chicago, IL): Min 
req: JD +3yrs atty exp in 
complex commercial litig., 
incl 2yrs policyholder-side 
ins. cvge litig. exp; IL state 
law license; admitted to 
at least one fed. ct. in IL; 
+add’l reqs. Send resume 
to: Casey Cook, Chief HR 
Officer, Jenner & Block 
LLP, 353 N. Clark St, 
Chicago, IL 60654. Ref: 
00032064. An EOE.

R E N T A L S
2 bedroom heated,
1 parking. 1,600.00. 
no smoking. no dogs. 
available 10/30/2022. on 
California ave north of Di-
versey. call 312.907.7224

RESEARCH
Have you had an un-
wanted sexual experi-
ence since age 18? Did 
you tell someone in your 
life about it who is also 
willing to participate? 
Women ages 18+ who 
have someone else in 
their life they told about 
their experience also will-
ing to participate will be 
paid to complete a con-
fidential online research 
survey for the Women’s 
Dyadic Support Study. 
Contact Dr. Sarah Ullman 
of the University of Illinois 
at Chicago, Criminology, 
Law, & Justice Depart-
ment at ForWomen@
uic.edu, 312-996-5508. 
Protocol #2021-0019.

PROFESSIONALS
& SERVICES
CLEANING SERVICES
CHESTNUT ORGANIZ-
ING AND CLEANING
SERVICES: especially for 
people who need an or-
ganizing service because 
of depression, elderly, 
physical or mental chal-
lenges or other causes 
for your home’s clutter, 
disorganization, dysfunc-
tion, etc. We can organize 
for the downsizing of your 
current possessions to 
more easily move into a 
smaller home. With your 
help, we can help to or-
ganize your move. We can 
organize and clean for the 
deceased in lieu of having 
the bereaved needing to 
do the preparation to sell 
or rent the deceased’s 
home. We are absolutely 
not judgmental; we’ve 
seen and done “worse” 
than your job assignment. 
With your help, can we 
please help you? Chest-
nut Cleaning Service: 
312-332-5575. www.
ChestnutCleaning.com

Raise a Healthy Family
Are you interested in 
raising vegan children 
but don\’t know where 
to start? For wellness 
parenting and whole food 
plant-based coaching 
with a board-certified 
pediatrician turned well-
ness coach, go to www.
traciwagner.com

Michigan Holiday Get-
away for 16 people. 6 
bedrooms with designer 
kitchen! Totally private! 
Exclusive use of 400 
acres w/lake, woods and 
walking trails. 100 miles 
from Chicago. Unplug 
for 5 nights Nov 23-27 
$12,000... 269-463-6315

A D U L T
S E R V I C E S
Danielle’s Lip Service, 
Erotic Phone Chat. 24/7. 
Must be 21+. Credit/
Debit Cards Accepted. 
All Fetishes and Fantasies 
Are Welcomed. Personal, 
Private and Discrete. 
773-935-4995
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