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JOBS
P r o j e c t  E n g i n e e r.
Evaluate construction 
scope, reqs & conditions. 
Prepare budget & bidding 
& discuss construction 
methods. Prepare con-
struction submittals to 
architect for approval. 
Analyze construction 
blueprints, shop draw-
ings, survey reports, 
& geo data, & confirm 
outcome. Prepare con-
struction schedule of 
values. Inspect on-site 
progress. Prepare proj-
ect-specific proposals. 
Create RFIs, submittals, 
potential change orders 
& contract mods. Prepare 
project closeout pkg. 
*Work is at Employer’s 
Office (44 West 60th St, 
Chicago, IL 60621) with 
travel to project site visits 
lasting 1-2 hrs per visit 
within the Chicago metro 
statistical area 4x per 
month.  Min Reqs: Mas-
ter’s in Civil Engineering, 
Construction Engineer-
ing & Mgmt, or closely 
rltd field +2 yrs exp in 
any occupational title 
involving the analysis of 
construction blueprints, 
shop drawings, & specs. 
Must possess 2 yrs exp 
in the following: analyzing 
construction blueprints, 
shop drawings, & specs; 
preparing bids & cost 
estimations for construc-
tion projects; conducting 
construction site visits to 
ensure conformance with 
construction drawings, 
blueprints, & specs; 
working with: Project 
Management software, 
such as Procore or 
Autodesk Bui ld; Bid 
Management software 
such as BuildingCon-
nected or Construction 
Connect; Construction 
Estimating Software such 
as Bluebeam, Autodesk 
Takeoff, or RSMeans; 
CAD software such as 
Auto CAD or Sketchup; 
& Scheduling software 
including Primavera P6 or 
Microsoft Project. Please 
send resume to Burling 
Builders, Inc. at careers@
burlingbuilders.com. 

EDI BUSINESS SYS-
TEMS ANALYST (Lake 
Forest, IL). Develop/
implement EDI (Elec-
tronic Data Interchange) 
transactions/software 
upgrades; implement 
system changes to ex-
isting EDI integrations 
using EDI ANSI X12 data 
formats, EDI communi-
cation protocols (FTP, 
HTTPS, AS2); perform 
quality/user acceptance 
testing. Bachelor’s deg. 
(or foreign equiv. deg.) 
in Comp. Sci., Technol-
ogy, or rel. + 5 yrs. prog. 
exp. in EDI, GMP, FTP, 
FTPS, HTTP, HTTPS, 
SMTP, AS2, unit testing 
and Sterling Integrator.  
Submit resume: Akorn 
Operating Company LLC, 
1925 West Field Court, 
Suite 300, Lake Forest, IL 
60045.

General Engineer
Commonwealth Edison 
seeks General Engineer 
in Oakbrook Terrace, 
IL to perform power 
system load flow, short 
circuit, and time-series 
analysis for Distributed 
Energy Resources (DER) 
integration; manage DER 
integration tools devel-
opment; and contribute 
to DER Management 
Systems (DERMS) and 
Battery Energy Storage 
Systems (BESS) projects. 
Requires B.S. degree in 
Electrical Engineering 
or related Engineering 
field, U.S. or foreign, 
plus 5 years’ electrical 
engineering experience 
or post-bachelor’s ac-
ademic research and 
teaching experience in 
building energy man-
agement systems and 
power system planning 
tools, full-time or part 
time.  Advanced degree 
in Electrical Engineering 
or related Engineering 
field or professional en-
gineering license may be 
substituted for one year 
of experience.  Reply 
by email with resume to 
jobposting@exeloncorp.
com.

World Food Enterprises, 
LLC. d/b/a Deli 4 You 
seeks an Advertising 
Sales Manager. Mail 
resume to 9 E Camp Mc-
Donald Road, Prospect 
Heights, IL.

IT Project Manager
Manage project execu-
tion to ensure adherence 
to budget, schedule, 
and scope, confer with 
project personnel to 
identi fy and resolve 
problems, monitor or 
track project milestones 
and deliverables, submit 
project del iverables, 
ensuring adherence to 
quality standards, assess 
current or future custom-
er needs and priorities by 
communicating directly 
with customers, con-
ducting surveys, or other 
methods, initiate, review, 
or approve modifi cations 
to project plans, schedule 
and facilitate meetings 
related to information 
technology projects, de-
velop and manage annual 
budgets for information 
technology projects, 
establish and execute a 
project communication 
plan, develop and man-
age work breakdown 
structure of information 
technology projects, 
monitor the performance 
of project team members, 
coordinate recruitment 
or selection of project 
personnel, assign duties, 
responsibi l i t ies,  and 
spans of authority to proj-
ect personnel, negotiate 
with project stakeholders 
or suppliers to obtain 
resources or materials. 
Mail résumé to Bruce 
Sokol, Clear Corp, 5005 
Newport Dr, Suite#100, 
Roll ing Meadows, IL 
60008

Mars, Incorporated: 
G loba l  D i rec tor  - 
Purpose Market ing 
– Chicago, IL. Telework 
permitted up to 2 days/
week. Partner w/ con-
tent & media experts, 
MarTech, commercial, 
agency, & production 
consultants to design 
pioneering approach 
that will step change 
Diversity & Inclusion (D&I) 
& sustainability impact 
in business comms & 
creative supply chain 
work. Job req’s Bach’s 
degree in Food Sci, Food 
Mktg, or rel fi eld + 3 yrs 
of mktg exp in each of 
the following industries 
in a CPG environment: 
human food, petcare, & 
confectionery. Up to 20% 
domestic & int’l travel req 
for business meetings. To 
apply, send resume iden-
tifying Job Code 120 to 
MarsTA-PIC@eff em.com. 
No calls.

Senior Software Appli-
cations Engineer (BI)
Senior Software Appli-
cations Engineer (BI). 
Dev., design & modify 
software. Bach. deg. 
(Comp. Sci., Computer 
Information Systems, or 
related) or foreign equiv. 
req’d. Min. 5 yrs.’ prog. 
resp. post-baccalaureate 
exp. in IT fi eld req’d. Prior 
exp. must incl. pos’n(s) 
a) implementing Tableau, 
Power BI & MSBI ana-
lytics to consolidate raw 
data & b) design & devel-
opment of MOLAP cubes. 
Peerless Network, Inc., 
Chicago, IL. Resumes 
to: Recruiting, Peerless 
Network, Inc., 433 W. Van 
Buren St., Suite 410S, 
Chicago, IL 60607 or 
via email to resumes@
peerlessnetwork.com.

Live Operations Associ-
ate Producer (Wargam-
ing (USA), Inc.; Chicago, 
IL): Coordinate Live Oper-
ations plans & associated 
detailed information with 
Events, Community, Cus-
tomer Support, Content, 
Customer Relationship 
Management, Creative 
& Marketing functions 
to deliver positive KPIs 
across all functions. Mail 
resumes to: Attn: HR, 
Wargaming (USA), Inc., 
P.O. Box 1206, Chicago, 
IL 60690.  An EOE.

TranSmart, LLC seeks 
Civil/Traffic Engineer 
in Chicago, IL to design 
traffic signals, traffic 
control plans, collect raw 
traffic data, run traffic 
simulations & create re-
ports & graphs. Requires 
bachelor’s degree in civil 
engineering with em-
phasis in transportation 
& knowledge of traffic 
operations analysis, sig-
nal timing & Auto-CAD or 
similar. Travel throughout 
Chicagoland area, as 
needed. Send CV to 
cheineke@transmartinc.
com. Use job code 
KA0123.

Software Developer is 
needed to develop and 
maintain Android apps. 
Req. Bachelor’s degree in 
Computer Science, Soft-
ware Engineering, or re-
lated fi elds. 1-year work 
experience in developing 
Android apps. Worksite: 
Chicago, Illinois. Send re-
sume: INFI USA INC, 159 
N Sangamon St. Suite 
200, Chicago IL 60607. 

Data Engineer - Fintech
Groupon, Inc. is seeking 
a Data Engineer - Fintech 
in Chicago, IL w/ the 
following responsibilities: 
understand the complete 
architecture of the data 
pipeline including scripts, 
code & data warehouse. 
Position based out of 
Chicago HQ. Can tele-
commute up to 100% 
from New Jersey. Apply 
at www.grouponcareers.
com by searching key-
word R27370.

Software Engineers 
(SE), SE IIs, SE IIIs, & 
SE IVs Groupon, Inc. is 
seeking multiple Software 
Engineers (SE), SE IIs, SE 
IIIs, & SE IVs in Chicago, 
IL to: dvlp, construct 
& implement the next 
generation of company 
products & features for 
Groupon’s web & mobile 
applications. Send res to 
apply@groupon.com & 
ref SECH1.

Purchasing Manager
CHUANGYI  METALS 
CORP. is seeking a 
Purchasing Manager to 
Establ ish purchasing 
agreements and ensure 
that all the terms and 
conditions are in con-
sistent with company’s 
business goals and 
policies; Evaluate, select, 
and negotiate contracts 
with all major vendors 
etc. Position requires a 
Master’s degree in Busi-
ness Administration or 
related, 1 year experience 
as a purchasing manager 
or related. Experience 
with SWOT strategy, etc. 
Any interested applicants 
can mail their resume 
with code CYPM23 to: 
CHUANGYI  METALS 
CORP., 3939 S. Karlov 
Ave, Chicago, IL 60632.

Financial Analyst
Database mgmt., mar-
keting activities, develop 
Zoho CRM system, 
create workflow rules & 
automations w/ Deluge.  
Analyze financial data, 
research & prepare fi-
nancial reports, articles 
& presentations. Compile 
prospect lists on strategic 
& fi nancial opportunities. 
Prepare Client Offering 
memos. Bachelors in 
Economics, Accounting 
or Finance, or foreign 
equivalent, plus 1 yr. exp. 
w/ financial analysis of 
business operations, & 1 
yr. exp. w/ each: Excel, 
VLOOKUP, Pivot Tables, 
CRM & SQL. Mail re-
sumes to: Thomas Blaige 
& Co., 980 N Michigan 
Ave, Ste. 1350, Chicago, 
IL 60611.

Antares Capital LP 
seeks a Lead Technol-
ogist, ETL Developer in 
Chicago, IL to develop 
SQL queries, SSIS pack-
ages, stored procedures, 
enhance and maintain 
data warehouse load 
process, and manage the 
gathering of requirements 
from a backend SQL 
perspective and imple-
ment the necessary and 
required business logic 
to transform the business 
requirements in SQL 
to provide the desired 
outcome. Will undertake 
any duties involved with 
query optimizations and 
performance tuning of 
various MS BI objects, 
c o l l a b o r a t i n g  w i t h 
business analysts and 
business stakeholders 
to ensure a thorough un-
derstanding of strategic 
data requirements and 
ensuring that the data 
hub is following the best 
practices in every aspect. 
Requirements: Bachelor’s 
degree in Computer 
Science, Information 
Technology, or a related 
field, and 7 years of 
progressively responsible 
experience in Database 
Management/Data Mod-
eling, SQL Development, 
including SQL Server 
and Visual Studio, ETL 
and in designing and 
coding SSIS packages. 
5 years of experience in 
SQL Server Performance 
Tuning and Query Opti-
mization and experience 
writing complex Stored 
Procedures, Functions, 
and views using SQL. 
Send resumes to Antares 
Capital LP HR debbie.
maggio@antares.com.

Senior Manager, Data 
Engineering Senior Man-
ager, Data Engineering 
(Schaumburg, IL): Devel-
op, solution, support & 
lead multiple IT initiatives 
and systems. Reqs.: MS 
+3 yrs. exp. Option for re-
mote work available. Mail 
resume w/ cover letter 
to: Central Garden & Pet, 
1340 Treat Blvd, Ste 600, 
Walnut Creek CA 94597 
Attn: HR.

R E N T A L S 
& REAL ESTATE
Spacious 2 bedroom 
apartment. New hard-
wood fl oors. Dining room. 
Appl iances. Laundry 
in-unit. Heat Included. 
Electric included. Month-
ly rent $1,550. 4321 w. 
Cortez st. Contact Mr. 
Henry 773 620-1241.

COMMUNITY
BIG EARS MUSIC 
FESTIVAL I am going 
to BIG EARS MUSIC 
FESTIVAL-Knoxville Tenn 
3/30-4/2. I would like to 
share transport and Hotel 
expenses. Please re-
spond if you are or know 
someone. I am in Arling-
ton Hts. geierabc@att.net

RESEARCH
Have you had an un-
wanted sexual experi-
ence since age 18? Did 
you tell someone in your 
life about it who is also 
willing to participate? 
Women ages 18+ who 
have someone else in 
their life they told about 
their experience also will-
ing to participate will be 
paid to complete a con-
fidential online research 
survey for the Women’s 
Dyadic Support Study. 
Contact Dr. Sarah Ullman 
of the University of Illinois 
at Chicago, Criminology, 
Law, & Justice Depart-
ment at ForWomen@
uic.edu, 312-996-5508. 
Protocol #2021-0019.

PROFESSIONALS
& SERVICES
CLEANING SERVICES
CHESTNUT ORGANIZ-
ING AND CLEANING
SERVICES: especially for 
people who need an or-
ganizing service because 
of depression, elderly, 
physical or mental chal-
lenges or other causes 
for your home’s clutter, 
disorganization, dysfunc-
tion, etc. We can organize 
for the downsizing of your 
current possessions to 
more easily move into 
a smaller home. With 
your help, we can help 
to organize your move. 
We can organize and 
clean for the deceased 
in lieu of having the be-
reaved needing to do the 
preparation to sell or rent 
the deceased’s home. 
We are absolutely not 
judgmental; we’ve seen 
and done “worse” than 
your job assignment. 
With your help, can we 
please help you? Chest-
nut Cleaning Service: 
312-332-5575. www.
ChestnutCleaning.com

PERSONALS
Domin ick  Defanso 
rocks Guns N Roses, 
Aerosmith, Black Sab-
bath, Marilyn Monroe in 
Icons. Pop star / rock 
stars fun with Tracy Guns, 
ACDC, Lady G, T. Swift, 
Slash, J. Bieber, Gwen 
S. Watch on the Tube, 
Downloads, T-shirts, 
album coves - CDs. My 
favorite song - BARBIE 
GIRL. We love you 
- America.
Thank you 
Hollywood Rose
Guns N Rose
Tracy Rock Rose
Lia Lakely

LEGAL NOTICE
Public Notice Of Name 
Change
I fi le to change my name 
from John Earl Poole 
to John Mwalimu Kali 
Mwindaji with the State 
Of Illinois Circuit Court in 
Cook County.

NOTICE OF PUBLIC 
SALE OF PERSONAL 
PROPERTY
Notice is hereby given 
that pursuant to Section 
4 of the Self-Storage Fa-
cility Act, State of Illinois, 
Chicago Northside Stor-
age - Lakeview /Western 
Ave Storage LLC will 
conduct sale(s) at www.
storagetreasures.com by 
competitive bidding start-
ing on February 8th and 
ending on February 15th 
@ 11:00 pm on the prem-
ises where the property 
has been stored, which 
are located at Chicago 
Northside Storage 2946 
N Western Ave. Chicago, 
IL 60618. 773-305-4000. 
In the matter of the 
personal property of the 
individual listed below, 
Chicago Northside Stor-
age - Lakeview. Nicolas 
K Spagnolo H03, Debra 
Strazzabosco N06, Perry 
Marshall N12, Kahlia 
Wil l iams O14, Adam 
Legler T147.  Purchases 
must be made with cash 
only and paid at the 
time of sale redemption. 
All goods are sold as is 
and must be removed 
at the time of purchase. 
The sale is subject to 
adjournment.

A D U LT 
SERVICES
Danielle’s Lip Service, 
Erotic Phone Chat. 24/7. 
Must be 21+. Credit/
Debit Cards Accepted. All 
Fetishes and Fantasies 
Are Welcomed. Personal, 
Private and Discrete. 
773-935-4995
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