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JOBS
Health Care Service Cor-
poration seeks Business 
Analyst (Chicago, IL) to 
work as a liaison among 
stakeholders to elicit, 
analyze, communicate 
and validate requirements 
for changes to business 
processes, policies and 
in format ion systems. 
REQS: This position reqs 
a Bach deg, or forgn equiv, 
in Tech or Bus Admin or a 
rel fl d � 2 @rs of exp as a 
proj mgr, sys analyst, or a 
rel position. Telecommut-
ing permitted. Applicants 
who are interested in this 
position should submit 
a complete resume in 
English to hrciapp@bcbsil.
com, search [Business 
Analyst � 9��2�5  . EOED.

Partner – Chicago, IL. 
Lead and manage do-
mestic and cross-border 
infrastructure and other 
energy-related projects, 
including renewable en-
ergy. Represent private 
and publ ic investors, 
developers, utilities, and 
sponsors in connection 
with the development, 
acquisit ion, sale, and 
fi nancing of infrastructure 
and energy assets in the 
United States and abroad. 
Review, prepare, analyze, 
and negotiate legal agree-
ments for these transac-
tions. Assign and review 
legal research, and provide 
legal advice to address 
the complex legal prob-
lems that arise in these 
transactions. Supervise 7 
Associate lawyers. Mon-
day - Friday ��� hours per 
week. Requires a United 
States Juris Doctor (J.D.) 
or alternatively a Master 
of Laws (LL.M.) degree, or 
the foreign equivalent; ad-
mission as a lawyer to the 
Illinois Bar; and eight years 
of experience as a projects 
lawyer with a focus on the 
energy sector. Also re-
quires passing background 
checks. Send resume 
and cover letter to Jenna 
Weissman, Norton Rose 
Fulbright US LLP, 1301 
Avenue of the Americas, 
5ew @ork, 5@ ���� . 5o 
phone calls or agencies.

A.T. Kearney, Inc. seeks 
2earney <nifi ed Collabora-
tion Specialist(s) to work in 
Chicago, 03 (with extensive 
travel and/or possible 
relocation in unanticipated 
locations throughout the 
U.S.) lead the planning, de-
sign, implementation, and 
ongoing support of unifi ed 
collaboration platforms. 
Collaborate with global, 
regional colleagues, in-
ternal business partners 
to maintain awareness of 
business requirements 
and opportunities that may 
leverage unifi ed collabora-
tion capabilities. Requires 
domestic travel up to 5� 
to ���. ;elecommuting 
is permitted. Require-
ments: Bach’s degree or 
frgn equvlnt in Computer 
Science, Engineering, 
Engineering Management 

or rltd fl d and 5 yrs rlvt exp. 
Exp to include �. Funda-
mental understanding and 
management of network 
infrastructure, audio & 
video conferencing, video 
codecs and br idges 
including TCP/IP, DNS, 
/.323, ?4PP, 8oS, Fax, 
E ��, 0SD5, 4P3S. 2. Ex-
perience deploying, man-
aging, and administering 
Cisco Unity, Voice gate-
ways: Cisco, Audio Codes; 
Cisco Jabber; Microsoft 
Teams Client; Telepres-
ence; Cisco media gate-
ways; Inbound/outbound 
routing using PRI and SIP 
trunks; Fax 9elay � ;.3� 
fax control protocol; and 
9ightFax. 3. Experience 
providing desk side and 
remote support for issues 
or failures impacting soft 
phone, unified collabora-
tion, audio and video con-
ferencing. �. Experienced 
many and confi gure audio 
codecs! ..�2 , ..�22. 
..���. 5. Experience 
confi guring and managing 
global �E.��� dial plans. 
Apply online at www.kear-
ney.com 9eference 03�2�.

Security Specialist VDV 
Royal Trans Inc. seeks 
a Security Specialist in 
Schaumburg Illinois to 
conduct post-accident 
and post-injury investi-
gations. Must have one 
year of experience in 
transportation specialty. 
P lease send resume 
to: info@vdvroyal.com.  

Accountant   Corrugated 
Supplies Company, LLC 
seeks Accountant  in 
Bedford Park, IL to drive 
accnting operations w/ 
continus prcss imprvmnt. 
Send Cover Letter and Re-
sume to: lnovak@vancraft.
com, Subject! 9ef
 ACC2�

Financial Engineer – 
Options Modeling HTAA 
Holdings LLC Chicago, 
IL  Design and support 
automated,  quant i ta-
tive-driven stock, option, 
and futures trading sys-
tems. Continually design, 
test, evaluate and monitor 
the implementation and 
performance of existing 
and new systems. Manage 
risk and trade portfolio of 
index, single name equity, 
and ETF options. Job 
duties may be performed 
remotely 2�-��� of the 
time.  Must have a Mas-
ter’s degree in Financial 
Engineering, Mathematics, 
Statistics or related field. 
Must be a Chartered 
Financial Analyst (CFA). 
Must have one (1) years 
of experience as Financial 
Engineer, Quantitative 
Analyst or Model Quant. 
Must have one (1) years of 
experience in options trad-
ing and risk management 
experience.  8ualified 
candidates should email 
their resumes to resumes@
hulltactical.com and refer-
ence job code FEO4���2.  

Slipstream Group Inc. 
seeks Field Outreach 
Manager in Chicago, IL 
to develop & track KPIs, 

serve as subject-matter 
expert in energy efficien-
cy programs, prepare & 
present reports. Requires 
bachelor’s in sustainable 
mgmt,  env i ronmenta l 
studies, related or equiv.; 
� mos of exp. as outreach 
manager, fi eld manager or 
sustainability occupation in 
a non-profi t setting; 03 driv-
ers’ lic.; Covid-�  vaccine. 
Exp. must include client 
relationship development 
in sustainability fi eld. 5�� 
travel in Chicago area.  
Can telecommute from 
Chicago area. Send CV 
to hr@slipstreaminc.org.   

Health Care Service 
Corporation seeks Senior 
Technology Delivery Con-
sultant (Chicago, IL) to as-
sist PDL with end-to-end 
delivery of Tech programs 
and projects to ensure 
successful execution and 
alignment with business 
needs. REQS: Bachelor’s 
degree, or foreign equiv-
alent, in IT, Com Sci, or 
Data Analytics or a related 
fi eld plus 5 @ears of expe-
rience as an IT Specialist 
or related occupation. 
Telecommuting permitted 
2 days a week. Applicants 
who are interested should 
submit a complete resume 
in English to hrciapp@
bcbsil.com, search [Senior 
Technology Delivery Con-
sultant � 9��2�� �. EOE.D.

Senior Network Engineer
PEA2� Capital 4anage-
ment, LLC seeks Senior 
Network Engineer  in 
Chicago, IL to be respon-
sible for bldg’g, config’g, 
& evolv’g PEA2�’s high 
bandwidth, & low latency 
netwrks across global 
offices & data centers. 
Reqs: Master’s degree or 
foreign equiv in Comp. 
Eng’gg, Electrical Eng’gg, 
or rel. fi eld & 2 yrs of post-
bacc. exp. as 5etwrk Ops 
Engineer, Tech Support 
Engineer, or rel. role. 
Exp. must incl. netwrk 
device mng’mnt; netwrk 
troubleshoot’g & maint.; 
Python; Ansible; 3inux; 
).P; OSPF; & 4ulticast 
communication. Email re-
sume! aernst'peak�.com.    

PEAK6 Capital Manage-
ment LLC seeks Trader in 
Chicago, Illinois to test and 
analyze trad’g strategies 
on the market & identify 
trading opportunit ies.  
Reqs. Bachelor’s degree 
or foreign equiv in Stats 
Econ or rel. fi eld & 2 yrs of 
post-bacc. exp. as ;rader 
or rel. role. Exp. must 
incl. apply’g adv options 
theory, mnging a portfolio; 
tech r isk-assessment 
skills & perform’g deep 
dives into analyt, & re-
search-based data. Pos’n 
will be HQ’d in Chicago, 
IL, but is a telecommut’g 
pos’n, allowing for remote 
employment from various 
unanticipated worksites 
t/o the U.S. Email resume: 
ae r ns t'peak� .com .

Lead Data Engineer
Thoughtworks  seeks 
Lead Data  Eng ineer 

(Professional Services) 
to work in Chicago, IL 
& various unanticipated 
U.S. locations to develop 
modern data architecture 
approaches for large-
scale, custom-designed, 
enterprise-level business 
intelligence and analytics 
projects using software 
development languages, 
such as Python and Java, 
and cloud-based data 
management technolo-
gies. Must have Master’s 
in Computer Science, 
Computer or Electrical 
Engineering, Information 
Systems, or related field. 
4ust have 2 years exp. in 
the job offered, Consul-
tant, Software Architect/
Engineer, or related IT 
position. Must have at 
least twenty-four (2�) 
months experience in! (�) 
Participating at all stages 
of the data management 
solutions delivery life-cy-
cle, including analysis, 
development, testing and 
deployment. Must have at 
least twelve (�2) months 
experience in! (�) Devel-
oping applications that are 
cloud ready/cloud-native 
using at least one of the 
primary cloud providers 
(A>S, .CP, or Azure); (2) 
Working with data ware-
house architectures, data 
lake architectural patterns, 
and streaming data ar-
chitectures for real-time 
processing; (3) Using Agile 
development methodolo-
gies including Continuous 
0 n tegra t ion ,  Ex t reme 
Programming, Continu-
ous Delivery, Test-Driven 
Development and pair 
programming; (4) Serving 
as a liaison between client 
and development team to 
defi ne scope and technical 
direction of the project 
including requirements 
gathering and design 
discussions and managing 
project deliverables and 
timeframes; (5) >orking on 
projects with distributed 
teams, including managing 
coordination across coun-
tries and time zones; and 
(�) Coaching and mentor-
ing junior developers and 
data engineers in all as-
pects of data solution de-
velopment, including Agile 
development methodol-
ogies. At least ��� travel 
across U.S. Send resume 
to ijobs@thoughtworks.
com w� Job 0D 3DE-2�2�.

A.T. Kearney, Inc. seeks 
2earney )usiness Office 
Coordinator(s) to work 
in Chicago, IL to Track 
all PERL-related leads 
and proposals. Analyze 
monthly budget and ac-
counting reports. Consult 
with managers to ensure 
that budget adjustments 
are made in accordance 
with program changes. 
Telecommuting permitted: 
Hybrid work schedule 
available with manager 
approval. Must live within 
a reasonable commuting 
distance of the Kearney 
office based in Chicago, 
IL. Requirements: Mastr’s 
degree or frgn equvlnt 
in Finance, Economics, 
or Business or rltd fld 
and � yrs exp in the fld 
of Finance, Economics, 
or Business or rltd fld. 

Alternatively, the emp will 
accept a Bach’s degree 
or frgn equvlnt in Finance, 
Economics, or Business or 
related fi eld and �� yrs of 
exp in the fld of Finance, 
Economics, or Business 
or rltd fld. Exp to include 
1. Construction manage-
ment- space planning/
design, supervising build 
outs, vendor selection/
tenders, construction doc-
umentations/standards/
regulations and quality 
control, and budgeting. 
2. CAD, >eb Design and 
Adobe for construction 
management. 3. Financial 
analysis ¶ analyzing fi nan-
cial data, calculating prof-
itability, variance analysis, 
budgeting and forecasting 
pertaining to client billable 
work -creating, monitoring, 
analyzing developing bud-
gets, forecasting revenues 
and expenses, develop-
ing budget models. 4. 
Financial reporting, cost 
controlling and regulations 
including knowledge of 
financial reporting stan-
dards, applicable tax laws, 
auditing standards, and 
compliance requirements. 
5. Corporate Finance 
and Software Experience 
including SAP, Oracle, 
Quick Books, 1C, IFRS, 
GAAP, Trello for account-
ing. �. Financial analysis 
and accounting including 
analyzing financial data/
statements ,  f inanc ia l 
reporting (internal and ex-
ternal), payroll calculation 
and processing. Re-bal-
ance fiscal and physical 
resources between dif-
ferent areas. Apply online 
at  www.kearney.com. 
9eference BJob 0D 03�25D.

IT Technician   IT Tech-
nic ian:  Resolve tech 
problems. Train users to 
max productivity. 5ew tech 
impl. Train users in both 
new & existing comp sys-
tems. Troubleshoot hard-
ware, software, network 
issues. 9evise existing 
systems, suggest improve-
ments. Analyze employer’s 
needs, design software 
solutions. /S. 2 yrs exp. 
9es! >est >ind Express, 
0nc; ��5� S Archer 9d, 
)edford Park 03 ���5�

C o y o t e  L o g i s t i c s , 
LLC Coyote Logistics, 
LLC seeks Marketing 
D a t a  a n d  I n s i g h t s 
Ana lys t  in  Ch icago, 
I L .  Te l e c o m m u t i n g 
pe rm i t ted .  App ly  @ 
www. jobpost ingtoday.
c o m  
 � � � �  

Validation Engineer Val-
idation Engineer, AbbVie 
Inc., North Chicago, IL. 
Responsible for creation, 
planning & approval of 
validation documents to 
support validation require-
ments. Responsible for 
participating in implemen-
tation & maintenance of 
eff ectiveness of the 8uality 
system to meet applicable 
regulatory requirements. 
Adhere to Good Manufac-
turing Practices (GMPs), 
0SO!�3��5, 0SO!�� ��, & 
2� CF9 �2�. Ensure that 
practices & procedures 
comply with company pol-
icies & applicable regula-
tions for the Quality areas. 

Execute tasks as required 
to implement Validation 
Master Plan & maintain in a 
validated state the equip-
ment, utilities, facilities, 
automated process con-
trollers, information sys-
tems, cleaning processes, 
manufacturing process to 
demonstrate that products 
will perform consistently as 
intended. Supervise con-
tract validation resources 
in the timely completion of 
activities in his/her area of 
responsibility. Represent 
department in quality au-
dits, both internal and ex-
ternal, regarding validation 
& engineering compliance. 
Perform Installation Qual-
ification (08), Operational 
8ualifi cation (O8), Perfor-
mance 8ualifi cation (P8), 
& Process Performance 
8ualifi cation (PP8). Partic-
ipate in implementation & 
maintenance of effective-
ness of  Quality System to 
meet all applicable regula-
tory requirements. Ensure 
that all practices & proce-
dures comply with com-
pany policies & applicable 
regulations for the Quality 
areas. Document control of 
nonconforming products & 
implementation of correc-
tive & preventative actions 
(CAPA) to address identi-
fi ed root causes compliant 
with 0SO!�3��5 standards 
& 2� CF9 �2�. �. Execute 
process monitoring plans 
based on quantifi able pro-
duction & quality metrics. 
Participate with plant & ex-
ternal engineering resourc-
es on new installations & 
systems to ensure that 
factory, site, & commis-
sioning documentation is 
in accordance with current 
Good Manufacturing Prac-
tices (“cGMP”) & supports 
validation. Must possess 
a Bachelor’s degree or 
foreign academic equiva-
lent in Biology, Chemistry, 
Biomedical Engineering, 
Mechanical Engineering 
or related scientific or 
engineering field plus an 
academic or industrial 
background in: (i) Good 
Manufacturing Practices 
( . 4 P s ) ,  0 S O ! � 3 � � 5 , 
0SO!�� ��, & 2� CF9 
�2�; (ii) 0nstallation 8ual-
ification (08), Operational 
8ualifi cation (O8), Perfor-
mance 8ualifi cation (P8), 
& Process Performance 
Qualification (PPQ); (iii) 
documenting control of 
nonconforming products 
& implementat ion of 
corrective & preventative 
actions (CAPA) to address 
identif ied root causes 
compliant with 0SO!�3��5 
standards & 2� CF9 
�2�. �; & (iv) executing 
process monitoring plans 
based on quantifi able pro-
duction & quality metrics. 
Apply online at https://
careers.abbvie.com/en 
& reference 9EF23��3S

TheMathCompany  is 
seek ing a  Associate 
Principal – Customer 
Success for Chicago, IL 
office. 4anage existing 
client engagements & 
drive growth in new tech & 
accts. To apply, send cover 
letter & C= to @uvaraj.r'
t h e m a t h c o m p a n y .
com. 9eq. 
������2

Accurate Group, Inc., 
Civil Engineer II in Lin-
colnshire, IL Responsible 
for construction, inspec-
tion, and reporting to res-
ident engineer. Managing 
projects, assisting with 
improvements to project 
management process 
and business systems, 
collaborating with client 
counterparts, conduct site 
inspections and prepare 
reports, implement ap-
plicable O44. Collab w 
subcontractors. Bachelors 
in civil engineering and 
�� months experience in 
civil engineering required. 
4ust have 0DO; certifi ca-
tion. ����,�5� annually 
Contact: Syed Hussaini 
a t  syedh@accg i .com

Medline Industries, LP in 
Mundelein, IL has multiple 
openings: A.) Sr. IS Devel-
oper Analyst(s) (MFG) to 
dsgn & implmnt soltns that 
sup’rt the mfg divisions. 
5o trvl. >F/ benefi t avail 3 
days/wk. Provides on- call 
sup’rt during non-work’g 
hrs. Apply at: https://
medline.tale o.net/career-
section/md_confidential/
jobapp ly. f t l? lang=en&
job=IN F01011K B. )
Sr. Business Systems 
Analyst(s) (Warehouse 
Automation) to implemt 
WHS automat’n in our 
log ist ics landscapes. 
No trvl.  WFH benefit 
avail. Must be in office 
2 days�wk. Apply at! 
ht tps : / /med l ine . ta leo .
n e t / c a r e e r s e c t i o n /
md_confidential/jobapply.
f t l ? l a n g = e n & j o b =
0 5 F � � � � 2 3
Daycare Center Manager 
Day Care Center Manager: 
Manage operations of day 
care center. Acquiring new 
clients/students. Build 
relationships & long-term 
coop w/parents. Customer 
support. Prep contracts, 
prep docs for accountant. 
Market services through 
social media, other ad-
vertising tools. Create, 
oversee budget & ex-
penses. Process intake of 
new students, employees. 
2 yrs’ exp as manager. 
Bachelor’s degree in any 
business-related fi eld. 9es! 
iLearn Center of Chicago, 
33C , 2�5� 5 Ashland 
Ave Chicago 03 �����

Assistant Professor , 
Chicago. Teach undergrad/
grad courses in mechani-
cal/aerospace eng. Initiate, 
sustain a research pro-
gram. PhD in mechanical, 
materials, or aerospace 
eng. or closely related req. 
Mail res., cov. let. to Melis-
sa Munoz-Rush, Manager, 
Human Resources, Illinois 
Institute of Technology, 
�� > 35th St., Ste. �3��, 
Ch icago ,  0 3  ����� .

Sr. Software Application 
Developer  Federal Home 
Loan Bank Chicago is 
seeking a Sr. Software 
Application Developer 
in Chicago, IL.  Create 
& mainta in  f inanc ia l 
software.  Remote work 
allowed up to ��� to 
time.  Must live w/in nor-
mal commuting distance 
of worksite. Send resume 
to SMorgan@fhlbc.com.
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Operat ions Manager
Operations Manager: Wo-
odridge IL. Direct, coord 
activities of employees to 
obtain optimum effi  ciency 
in sales & ops to max prof-
its. Coord marketing, sales. 
Review financial state-
ments. Direct admin activ-
ities directly related to prov 
supp services for transp 
industry. Prep staff work 
schedules & assign specif-
ic duties. Process payroll. 
Bachelor’s in Business 
Mgnt. Fax: Line Transpor-
tation Inc; 630-755-4378

(Huntley, IL) Hiwin Cor-
poration seeks Software 
Engineer w bach or for 
deg equiv in CS or rel fl d 
& 3 yrs exp in job off erd or 
in sftwr dev. Must have exp 
w SDLC phases in sftwr 
des & deploymt; Agile/
Scrum meth for sftwr dev; 
& Angular 11, React.js, 
HTML, CSS, JavaScript, & 
jQuery. Apply to HR, 12455 
Jim Dhamer Dr, Huntley, 
IL 60142 or https://hiwin.
com/company/careers/

Morningstar, Inc. seeks 
Software Engineer (multi-
ple positions) in Chicago, 
IL to write Python code, by 
following software devel-
opment best practices & 
computer science funda-
mentals (30%). BS deg in 
Computer Science, Com-
puter Engineering, or rltd 
fi eld & 2 yrs of relevant exp 
req’d. Add’l specifi c skills 
req’d. For position details & 
to apply, visit: https://www.
morningstar.com/careers; 
ref. job ID REQ-044419.

Data Scientist Groupon, 
Inc. is seeking a Data 
Scient ist  in Chicago, 
IL  w/  the  fo l lowing 
responsibilities: Design & 
build scalable computing 
systems for collecting, 
integrating, & processing 
large sets of structured 
& unst ructured data 
from disparate sources 
& feed the results of the 
computations to other 
downstream systems w/in 
established service level 
agreement timeframes. 
May telecommute up to 
100% from any location 
in the U.S. Apply at www.
grouponcareers.com by 
searching keyword R28330

Medica l  Laboratory 
Technologist Clinicare 
Lab Ltd. seeks a Medical 
Labo ra to r y  Techno l -
ogist. Mail resume to 
11S270 S Jackson St, 
Suite 103, Burr Ridge, IL 

Morningstar Research 
Services LLC seeks a 
Lead Software Engineer 
(multiple posit ions) in 
Chicago, IL to develop, im-
plement, maintain, & lead 
eff orts on quant solutions 
& tools that drive invest-
ment discussion-making 
process for company’s cli-
ent base. BS deg. in Com-
puter Science, Computer 
Engg, Electronics Engg, or 
rltd Engg field, or foreign 
equiv & 5 yrs of rlvnt soft 
engg exp. Alternatively, MS 
deg. Computer Science, 
Computer Engg, Elec-
tronics Engg, or rltd Engg 
fi eld, or foreign equiv & 3 
yrs of rlvnt soft engg exp. 

Add’l specifi c skills req’d. 
For position details & to 
apply, visit: https://www.
morningstar.com/careers; 
ref. job ID REQ-043821.

IT Technical Specialist IT 
Technical Specialist, Abb-
Vie Inc., North Chicago, IL. 
Provide in-depth technical 
expertise & direction in 
development and support 
of Supply Chain Planning 
systems/programming 
requirements & processes 
(e.g. new, enhancements 
o r  ma in tenance ) ,  i n 
preparation of application 
system specif ications, 
& in the development, 
testing, & implementation 
of efficient, cost effective 
application solutions. Work 
with Supply chain planning 
system JDA including JDA 
Demand Planning Solution, 
JDA Collaborate, JDA 
Fulfi llment & ESP modules. 
Utilize SaaS Demand. Re-
sponsible for compliance 
with applicable Corporate 
& Divisional Policies & 
procedures. Serve as tech-
nical expert or lead proj-
ects/programs & technical 
staff to develop, test & 
implement signifi cant new 
products, or operational 
improvements or devise 
new approaches to prob-
lems at the division/busi-
ness unit. Conduct inves-
tigation activity/research 
& give technical advice to 
adoption or integration of 
new technologies & their 
business impact. Work 
with LCM for master data 
issues & maintenance. 
Utilize knowledge on Data 
Warehousing concepts 
such as Star Schema 
& Snow-flake Schema. 
Experience with Agile 
methodology & tools like 
Jira & Service now. Utilize 
experience with Hadoop 
platform &  Hue. Utilize ex-
perience with Lead in the 
development of standards 
& procedures & publish/
communicate f indings 
via IOI’s, presentations, 
white papers, etc. Provide 
expertise to develop and 
maintain SCCM solution. 
Experience with Windchill 
for document manage-
ment. Enhance design 
and conduct performance 
monitoring & capacity 
planning. Install, test & 
upgrade releases & associ-
ated products. Experience 
with SAP Sales order pro-
cessing, Purchase order 
processing & Inventory 
management. Evaluate & 
recommend new software, 
utilities, & tools. Set  strat-
egy for implementing new 
technologies. Responsible 
for establishing the way the 
program works (confi gura-
tion responsibilities) in spe-
cialized systems (JDA & BI 
solutions). Utilize BI (Busi-
ness Intelligence) reporting 
tools such as COGNOS, 
QlikView, & QlikSense to 
enhance & change the 
way program works using 
technical configuration 
skills in JDA software. Re-
sponsible for total project 
scope, budget, completion 
within budget constraints 
& schedules completion 
date. Responsible for suc-
cessful and timely com-
pletion of all tasks/projects 
under direct & matrix con-

trol. Post completion audit 
of project after implemen-
tation to verify expected 
benefits vs. costs, both 
development & operating. 
Must possess a Bachelor’s 
degree or foreign academ-
ic equivalent in Computer 
Science, Engineering, 
Information Technology, or 
a related fi eld of study with 
at least 6  years of practical 
experience in the following: 
(i) experience working with 
Supply chain planning 
system JDA including JDA 
Planning Solution, JDA 
Collaborate, JDA Fulfill-
ment and ESP modules; 
(ii) experience with SaaS 
Demand;  (ii i) utilizing 
knowledge on Data Ware-
housing concepts such as 
Star Schema and Snow-
fl ake Schema; (iv) utilizing 
BI (Business Intelligence) 
reporting tools such as 
COGNOS, QlikView, and 
QlikSense to enhance and 
change the way program 
works using technical con-
fi guration skills in JDA soft-
ware; (v) experience with 
LCM, SCCM and Windchill; 
(vi) experience with SAP 
Sales order processing, 
Purchase order processing 
& Inventory management; 
& (vii) experience with Agile 
methodology and tools like 
Jira, Service Now and Hue. 
Apply online at https://
careers.abbvie.com/en 
& reference REF24101S.

HR Manager Wells Plumb-
ing and Heating Supplies, 
Inc. Chicago, IL. Cond RP 
& PEQ, devlp & impl EE 
recognit prgm, res & anal 
benf pkg, mgt HR bdgt, 
devlp & impl HR policy, 
oversee EE benf prgm, 
anal EE relat & cond rept, 
reslv EE dispts. Req’s MS 
in HR, MBA &5 Yrs as HR 
Mgr. w exp. in TAS &TM, 
C&B, EE relat. Mail res to 
HR Dept. Wells Plumbing 
and Heating Supplies Inc., 
916 W 21st St, Chicago, 
IL 60608 or email to hr@
w e l l s p l u m b i n g . c o m .

Assoc ia te  Bus iness 
Systems Consultant As-
sociate Business Systems 
Consultant, AbbVie Inc., 
North Chicago, IL  Respon-
sible for delivering precise 
functional specifi cation to 
include process workfl ows, 
business rules, interface 
design specification and 
source to target data map-
ping. Deliver and support 
SAP solutions related 
to Finance and Costing 
area and facilitate design 
sessions to define the 
data design and processes 
in support of business 
requirements. Coordinate 
and lead the end-to-end 
execution of Record to 
Report (RTR) solutions, 
related projects and tech-
nology implementations. 
Introduce best practice 
and process improvement 
ideas. Gather business 
requirements, perform data 
related analysis, investiga-
tion and audits. Respon-
sible for Project Planning, 
Requirement scoping, 
effort estimation, solu-
tion and design reviews, 
change management and 
bus iness stakeholder 
management.  Employ 
experience in all phases 

of a project in the areas 
of General Ledger (FI-GL), 
Account Receivables (AR), 
Account Payables (AP), 
Asset Accounting (FAA), 
Cost Element Accounting 
(CEA), Cost Center Ac-
counting (CCA), Internal or-
ders (IO), Product Costing 
(PC) and Profi tability Anal-
ysis (CO-PA). Responsible 
for the Asset Accounting 
Process, including IFRS 
and USGAAP standards, 
Investment management 
and pro ject  systems 
conf igurat ion,  test ing 
and support process. 
Employ understanding 
of business processes, 
accounting principles, 
systems configuration, 
enhancements, and data 
migration processes. Em-
ploy experience in Master 
Data Mapping / Migration 
from Legacy system to 
SAP R/3 using LSMW and 
Batch input. Responsible 
for creating Extract files, 
Writing Transform queries, 
and loading files utilizing 
SAP FDW and custom 
report for extraction and 
LTMC tools for loading 
f i les. Understand and 
adhere to corporate stan-
dards regarding applicable 
Corporate and Divisional 
Policies, including code of 
conduct, safety, SOX com-
pliance, data security, and 
the software development 
lifecycle. Must possess a 
Bachelor’s degree (or for-
eign academic equivalent) 
in Finance, Accounting, 
Computer Science, Infor-
mation Technology, Engi-
neering, or highly related 
fi eld of study & 5 years of 
related experience; Will 
accept a Master’s degree 
(or foreign academic equiv-
alent) in Finance, Account-
ing, Computer Science, 
Information Technology, 
Engineering, or highly relat-
ed fi eld of study & 2 years 
of related experience. For 
each alternative, must 
possess at least 2 years of 
experience in: (i) delivering 
and supporting SAP solu-
tions related to Finance 
and Costing area and 
facilitate design sessions 
to define the data design 
and processes in support 
of business requirements; 
(ii) Project Planning, Re-
quirement scoping, effort 
estimation, solution and 
design reviews, change 
management and business 
stakeholder management; 
(iii) all phases of a project 
in the areas of General 
Ledger (FI-GL), Account 
Receivables (AR), Account 
Payables (AP),  Asset 
Accounting (FAA), Cost 
Element Accounting (CEA), 
Cost Center Accounting 
(CCA), Internal orders 
(IO), Product Costing (PC) 
and Profitability Analysis 
(COPA); (iv) Asset Account-
ing Process, including IFRS 
and USGAAP standards, 
Investment management 
and project systems con-
fi guration, testing and sup-
port process; (v) Master 
Data Mapping / Migration 
from Legacy system to 
SAP R/3 using LSMW and 
Batch input; & (vi) creat-
ing Extract files, Writing 
Transform queries, and 
loading files utilizing SAP 
FDW and custom report for 

extraction and LTMC tools 
for loading files. 100% 
telecommuting permitted. 
Apply online at https://
careers.abbvie.com/en 
& reference REF24102W. 
Salary Range: $145,039.85 
-  $157,500 per year

Senior AEM Engineer Se-
nior AEM Engineer,  AbbVie 
Inc., North Chicago, IL. 
Responsible for building 
multi-brand component 
systems, platform con-
figuration, release man-
agement & Cloud Service 
implementation utilizing 
Adobe Experience Manag-
er (AEM). Design & develop 
complex use-cases such 
as dynamic components, 
core component exten-
sions, & API integrations. 
Work on Multisite Manager 
(MSM) so as to get same 
structure & content on all 
the versions of website. 
Develop custom compo-
nents related to parses 
using CRXDE-lite for the 
component structure & 
CRXDE for scripting. Assist 
with authoring complex 
components on pages. 
Responsible for supporting 
application postproduction 
& maintenance, attending 
daily meetings & working 
in an Agile Environment. 
Monitor & support AEM 
environments by reviewing 
Splunk logs errors reported 
by Adobe & follow up with 
project teams. Resolve is-
sues by working with AEM 
developers to triage issues 
in the lower environments 
surface advanced issues 
to the team. Coordinate 
& communicate service 
packs & patches. Manage 
instal lation of service 
packs & security patches 
& coordinate testing with 
project teams. Manage & 
deploy dispatcher confi gs 
by supporting/resolving 
dispatcher config issues. 
Monitor & support lower 
environments by restarting 
bundles & performing other 
admin console tasks for 
application teams in the 
lower environments when 
requested. Move content 
packages from upper 
environment to lower envi-
ronments. Work on sprint 
stories & manage/verify 
deployments. Work on 
Components, Templates, 
Taxonomy,  metada ta 
management, Forward & 
Reverse Replication, Work-
fl ows, Content Publishing, 
Tagging,  Deployment 
(Maven). Participate in 
implementation of AEM 
solutions including design, 
definition, & development 
of AEM content type 
models, workflows, tem-
plates, components, & 
use permissions. Build & 
iterate a comprehensive 
set of shared components 
& services for sites & prod-
ucts on AEM Sites. Work to 
evaluate & implement inte-
grations with other Adobe 
or third-party products. 
Employ experience build-
ing service-oriented archi-
tecture & microservices 
using REST or GraphQL. 
Implement new features in 
a highly collaborative envi-
ronment with product man-
agers, UI/UX experts, & 
fellow engineers. Contrib-
ute to a future-ready, high 

quality, & performant code 
base. Share your technical 
solutions & product ideas 
with the team. Collaborate 
on defining internal pro-
cesses, tools, & application 
architecture.  Approve 
merge requests from other 
team members. Collabo-
rate with the business & 
product teams, including 
product managers, UX & 
visual designers, & fellow 
engineers. Contribute to a 
future-ready, high quality, 
& performant code base. 
Work with DevOps & QA 
teams to optimize perfor-
mance & experience. Work 
with product team to refi ne 
product requirements as 
user stories. Collaborate 
with agencies & colleagues 
on product experience 
design. Must possess a 
Bachelor’s degree or for-
eign academic equivalent 
in Computer Science, 
Engineering or a highly 
related fi eld of study with 
at least 5 years of related 
progressive experience in 
the following: (i) building 
multi-brand component 
systems, platform con-
figuration, release man-
agement, & Cloud Service 
implementation utilizing 
Adobe Experience Man-
ager (AEM); (ii) supporting 
application postproduction 
& maintenance, attending 
daily meetings & working 
in an Agile Environment; (iii) 
developing custom com-
ponents related to parses 
using CRXDE-lite for the 
component structure & 
CRXDE for scripting;(iv) 
implementation of AEM 
solutions including design, 
definition, & development 
of AEM content type 
models, workflows, tem-
plates, components, & use 
permissions; & (v) building 
service-oriented archi-
tecture & microservices 
using REST or GraphQL. 
Apply online at https://
careers.abbvie.com/en 
& reference REF24100J.

Social Media Strategist
Dvlp social media content 
strategies. Req master’s 
deg. App: VJN Group DBA 
Tea Ninja, 3139 N Broad-
way, Chicago IL 60657

Operations Research 
Analyst I Profusion Foods 
Inc. seeks an Operations 
Research Analyst I based 
at Chicago, IL to optimize 
sales efficiency. Position 
req a Master’s degree in 
Science, Eng, Biz Admin, 
etc. & 6+ months of exp. 
Send resume to E. Chen, 
President, PFI, 7131 W 
61st St, Chicago, IL 60638

IOS Developer Levi, Ray 
& Shoup, Inc seeks an 
IOS Developer in Chicago, 
IL to bui ld new IOS 
applications extending 
functionality of current 
web applications to IOS 
devices. Telecommuting 
i s  p e r m i t t e d .  M a y 
a p p l y  h t t p s : / / w w w.
j o b p o s t i n g t o d a y .
c o m /  R e f  # 8 2 5 9 7 .

Associate  Engineer, 
R&D West Chicago, IL - 
Simpson Strong-Tie Co., 
Inc. - Manage prod. perf. 
test progs. 10% dom./
int’l travel. Send resume 

to HR@strongtie.com & 
incl ref #AERD in subj. line

S e n i o r  S u p e r v i s o r, 
Molecular Lab Tempus AI 
seeks a Senior Supervisor, 
Molecular Lab in Chicago, 
IL. Provide daily oversight 
of a cutting-edge molecular 
workfl ow to provide high-
quality next-generation 
sequencing data with 
rapid turnaround times, 
including tumor genomic, 
germline genomic, and 
transcriptomic sequencing. 
T e l e c o m m u t i n g 
pe rm i t t ed .  App l y  @ 
www. jobpost ingtoday.
c o m  # 6 8 3 1 4 .

Application Developer
Dynamic Motion Control 
(Chicago, IL) seeks Ap-
plication Developer to 
prototype/review/develop 
& test apps. & systems 
for client projects. Must 
take & pass pre-hire DMC 
coding test. Remote work 
option 50% of time, but 
req. to travel to local offi  ce 
remaining 50% of time. 
Apply at dmcinfo.com/
careers, Job ID: 2360980

Logistic Coordinator Lo-
gistic Coordinator: Orland 
Park IL. Coord activities 
of transp comp. Monitor 
compl w/regs. Bank de-
posits. Resolve complaints 
re transp services. Clerical 
& admin functions: drafting 
corresp, sched apts, org, 
maintain paper & electronic 
files, prov info to clients, 
employees, drivers-oper-
ators. Enter info into data-
base. Op offi  ce eqpt. Prep 
docs for accountant. Vo-
cational degree (secondary 
education) in logistics or 
foreign equivalent. Res: 
Katandy Services Compa-
ny, exigency@comcast.net

Associate CONSULTANT, 
STRUCTURAL Engineer 
(Chicago, IL) WSP USA 
Buildings Inc.: Assist w/ 
collecting, compiling, & 
analyzing data from the 
physical work site, sur-
veys, blueprints, GIS data, 
maps, geotechnical data, 
& other matrices. Req’s 
a mast’s (or frgn equiv) 
in Civil Engg, Structural 
Engg, or rltd + 9 mos exp 
as a Structural Eng, Civil 
Eng, or rltd. To apply, email 
jobs@wsp.com, ref #1130.

Naos Support Software 
Engineer Naos Support 
Software Engineer, Forsk 
US Inc 200 S Wacker Dr, 
#3100, Chicago, IL 60606 
$103K, MS in Software 
Eng or closely related fi eld 
& 1 yr experience as Soft-
ware Dev or related field, 
exp must include Python 
development and Docker, 
Linux & relational & NoSQL 
databases. Pls mail CV 
directly to Forsk at address 
above, attn Recruitment. 

Senior Software Develop-
ers Java/J2EE Oak Brook, 
IL: Dvlp various custom 
modules us ing Java, 
Alfresco SDK, & front end 
techs using Alfresco plat-
form on business needs. 
Develop MVC architecture 
using Servlets, JSP, Struts 
Framework, Hibernate 
Framework, Spring Frame-
work, Implement UI design 

by writing HTML5/HTML, 
CSS3/CSS, Bootstrap 3.0, 
JavaScript, jQuery. Send 
res to: Maxil Technology 
Solutions, Inc., 2625 But-
terfield Rd., Suite 138S, 
Oak Brook, IL 60523.

Sr. Software Engineer
Groupon, Inc. is seeking 
a Sr. Software Engineer in 
Chicago, IL w/ the follow-
ing responsibilities: Dvlp, 
construct & implement 
the next generation of 
company prdcts & features 
for Groupon’s web & mo-
bile applications; design 
high-performance RESTful 
service-oriented architec-
tures & software that is fast 
& efficient for millions of 
users. Up to 100% remote 
work allowed from any-
where in the U.S.; can live 
anywhere in the U.S. Co 
headquarters in Chicago, 
IL. Apply at www. groupon-
careers.com by search-
ing keyword R28275.

PROFESSIONALS
& SERVICES
CLEANING SERVICES
CHESTNUT ORGANIZ-
ING AND CLEANING
SERVICES: especially for 
people who need an orga-
nizing service because of 
depression, elderly, phys-
ical or mental challenges 
or other causes for your 
home’s clutter, disorgani-
zation, dysfunction, etc. 
We can organize for the 
downsizing of your current 
possessions to more easily 
move into a smaller home. 
With your help, we can help 
to organize your move. We 
can organize and clean 
for the deceased in lieu 
of having the bereaved 
needing to do the prepa-
ration to sell or rent the 
deceased’s home. We are 
absolutely not judgmental; 
we’ve seen and done 
“worse” than your job as-
signment. With your help, 
can we please help you? 
Chestnut Cleaning Ser-
vice: 312-332-5575. www.
ChestnutCleaning.com

AUDITIONS
IDM/EDM ARTISTS 
W A N T E D  o r i g i n a l 
m u s i c  o n l y.  c o n -
tact :  idm-edm.com

M A T C H E S
Al l  romant ic  dates 
women  wanted  A l l 
ro m a n t i c  f u n  d a t e s 
all requests 24.7 Call 
(773)  977-8862 swm

Late 50’s MWM Seeks 
a European Lady for 
Adult Friendship I’m 58, 
white, clean d/d free. ISO 
of fun discreet European 
woman that would love 
some adult attention. 
Have many interests


